THE CORPORATION OF THE
TOWN OF PELHAM

BY-LAW #1078 (1986)

Being a by-law to amend By-law #877 (1983),
being a by-law to provide for drainage works,
in the Town of Pelham, in the Regional
Municipality of Niagara, known as the

Ridgeville Drain.

WHEREAS By-law #877 (1983) was passed pursuant to the Drainage
Act on the 10th. day of April, 1984 authorizing the borrowing of $170,599.99
upon the credit of the Corporation, being the amount to be contributed by the
municipality for construction of the drainage works less the total amount of,
(a) grants received under Section 85 of the

Act; and

(b) commuted payments made in respect of the

lands and roads assessed.

AND WHEREAS the final cost of the Ridgeville Drain repair and
improvement made under By-law #877 (1983) of the Corporation of the Town of
Pelham is $170,865.26;

AND WHEREAS the Drainage Act, R.S.0. 1980 authorizes the
amending of the provisional by—-law where the actual costs of the drainage

works are lower or higher than the estimated costs;

NOW THEREFORE THE COUNCIL OF THE CORPORATION OF THE TOWN OF
PELHAM ENACTS AS FOLLOWS:

(D THAT Section 2 (i) of By-law #877 (1983) be amended by

deleting the figure "$170,599.99" and substituting "$170,865.26" in its
place.

con'teesos




(2) THAT Section 3 (i) of By-law #877 (1983) be amended by
deleting "$157,260.95" and substituting “$157,154.92" in its place.

(3) THAT said By-law #877 (1983) be further amended by striking
out the schedule of assessment attached thereto and substituting the revised

schedule of assessment attached hereto and forming part of this by-law.

READ A FIRST, SECOND AND THIRD TIME
AND FINALLY PASSED BY COUNCIL THIS
21st. DAY OF JULY, 1986 A.D.

L g

MAYOR C/ '

S Y -

CLERK <&




